Evaluated Results Of Bids And RFPs

Tentatively Scheduled For Recommendation To The City Council
Listed by Bid/RFP Number - Scroll down to see all postings

RFP Number:

RFP B2018-13

RFP Title:

Request for Proposal for Updating the Strategic Plan
Community Profile/Environmental Scan

RFP Submittal Deadline Date:

Monday, May 14, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

PlaceWorks

Tentative date of the City Council Meeting for the

intended award of contract

November 6, 2018

Results
Ranking Vendor Name City State Evaluation Proposal Price
Score
1 PlaceWorks Santa Ana CA 91 $66,027.00
2 The Ramsey Group Valencia CA 80 $42,750.00
3 A3K Consulting Pasadena CA 73 $69,354.80

Posted 10/05/18

RFP Number:

RFP B2018-14

RFP Title:

Public Opinion Survey

Request for Proposal for Updating the Strategic Plan

RFP Submittal Deadline Date:

Monday, May 14, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

FM3 Research

Tentative date of the City Council Meeting for the

intended award of contract

November 6, 2018

Results
Ranking Vendor Name City State Evaluation Proposal Price
Score
1 FM3 Research Los Angeles CA 80 $75,000.00
2 Probolsky Research Newport Beach CA 71 $27,550.00

Posted 10/05/18

RFP Number:

B2018-22

RFP Title:

Services

RFP for North Torrance Well Field Phase I, I-108: Design Review

RFP Submittal Deadline Date:

Monday, July 23, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

Tetra Tech, Inc., Irvine, CA

Tentative date of the City
Council Meeting for the
intended award of contract

October 23, 2018

| Results
Ranking Vendor Name City State | Interviewed | Evaluation | Proposal Price
Score

1 Tetra Tech, Inc. | Irvine CA Yes 348 $258,889.00 Proposed
$308,889.00 Negotiated and
with additional scope

2 West Yost Irvine CA Yes 339 $254,228.00

3 Geosyntec Huntington CA No 268 $226,215.00

Beach
4 Carollo Los Angeles CA No 258 $262,657.32
5 AECOM Long Beach CA No 239 $566,971.00

Interested parties may view more detailed information on the project website at
http://ntwfp.torranceprojects.city/SitePages/Home.aspx

Posted 9/26/18
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RFP Number:

B2018-23

RFP Title:

RFP for Accela System Implementation Services — Phase 4 Project

RFP Submittal Deadline Date:

August 20, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

TruePoint Solutions, Loomis, CA

Tentative date of the City Council Meeting for the
intended award of contract

November 6, 2018

Results
Ranking Vendor Name City State Evaluation Score Proposal Price
1 TruePoint Solutions Loomis CA 93.3 $ 297,120.00
2 Woolpert Englewood CcO 86.4 $ 380,206.00
3 Avocette New British 80.2 $ 530,550.00
Westminster | Columbia
4 SEP Technology Consulting New York NY 78.3 $ 207,366.00
5 Visionary Integration Folsom CA 75.0 $ 733,950.00
Professionals
Posted 9/12/18
Bid Number: B2018-25
Bid Title: Sidewalk Repair for Handicap Accessibility, 1-135

Bid Submittal Deadline Date:

August 29, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

Kalban, Inc. of Santa Clarita, CA

Tentative date of the City Council Meeting for the
intended award of contract

October 23, 2018

Results
Vendor Name City State Bid Price
*Kalban, Inc. Santa Clarita CA $1,098,000.00
Nobest Inc. Garden Grove CA $1,172,000.00
Gentry General Engineering Rancho CA $1,177,740.00
Cucamonga
EBS General Engineering, Inc. Corona CA $1,276,900.00
Golden Phoenix Construction Pasadena CA $1,290,864.50
Hardy & Harper, Inc. Santa Ana CA $1,777,000.00

Posted 9/05/18

Interested parties may view more detailed information on the project website at https://www.torranceca.gov/our-city/public-

works/civil-and-traffic-engineering/capital-improvement-projects/sidewalk-repair-for-handicap-access-cdbg-fy18-19-i-135

B2018-30 Furnish Eleven 2018 or later Pick up, Utility, and Dump

Bid Number: Trucks
MODEL 2019 Ford F-150 XL 4x2 Regular Cab Pick-up Truck w/8' Box or Equivalent
Bid Submittal Deadline Date: September 12, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

AutoNation Ford

City Council Meeting Approval

Date: October 23, 2018
Results
Price Per Unit (3
Ranking | Vendor Name City/State ea) Bid Amount
1 AutoNation Ford Torrance, CA $26,000.77 $78,002.30
2 Fairway Ford Placentia, CA $26,281.09 $78,843.27
3 Frontier Ford Santa Clara, CA $26,580.55 $79,741.65
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$81,595.61 includes 2%

4 Reynolds Buick/GMC Covina, CA $27,198.54 terms

5 Advanced Truck Body Central Point, OR $27,911.62 $83,734.85
6 TransWest Truck Center | Fontana, CA $32,271.84 $96,815.52
7 National Auto Fleet Watsonville, CA NO BID
8 Western Truck Exchange | Los Angeles, CA NO BID

Bid Number: B2018-30 Furnish Eleven 2018 or later Pick up, Utility, and Dump
Trucks

Ford F-250 XL SuperCab w/Pacific Utility Body #840790 V/H or
Equivalent

September 12, 2018

Frontier Ford

MODEL 2019

Bid Submittal Deadline Date:
Recommendation of Award to:
City Council Meeting Approval

Date: October 23, 2018
Results
Price Per Unit (2
Ranking | Vendor Name City/State ea) Bid Amount
1 Frontier Ford Santa Clara, CA $38,908.50 $77,817.00
$78,872.83 1% tax
2 AutoNation Ford Torrance, CA $39,436.42 considered
3 Fairway Ford Placentia, CA $39,092.59 $78,185.17
4 Advanced Truck Body Central Point, OR $41,356.24 $82,712.48
$84,648.85 includes 2%
5 Reynolds Buick/GMC Covina, CA $42,324.43 terms
6 National Auto Fleet Watsonville, CA $46,157.33 $92,314.66
7 TransWest Truck Center | Fontana, CA $47,489.34 $94,978.68
8 Western Truck Exchange | Los Angeles, CA NO BID

Bid Number: B2018-30 Furnish Eleven 2018 or later Pick up, Utility, and Dump
Trucks

Ford F-350 XL DRW Reg Chassis Cab w/Harbor #HTFB-120-96S FB
Dump or Equiv.

September 12, 2018

Fairway Ford

MODEL 2019

Bid Submittal Deadline Date:

Recommendation of Award to:
City Council Meeting Approval

Date: October 23, 2018
Results
Price Per Unit (2

Ranking | Vendor Name City/State ea) Bid Amount
1 Fairway Ford Placentia, CA $49,283.31 $98,566.62
2 Frontier Ford Santa Clara, CA $50,190.50 $100,381.00
3 Advanced Truck Body Central Point, OR $51,597.78 $103,195.55
4 TransWest Truck Center | Fontana, CA $52,496.83 $104,993.66
5 Western Truck Exchange | Los Angeles, CA $60,063.65 $120,127.30
6 National Auto Fleet Watsonville, CA $60,735.09 $121,470.17
7 AutoNation Ford Torrance, CA NO BID
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8 Reynolds Buick/GMC Covina, CA NO BID
Bid Number: B2018-30 Furnish Eleven 2018 or later Pick up, Utility, and Dump
Trucks
MODEL 2019 Ford F-350 XL DRW Regular Chassis Cab w/Rugby Eliminator LP Dump

or Equiv.

Bid Submittal Deadline Date:

September 12, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

Fairway Ford

City Council Meeting Approval

Bid Number:

Trucks

Date: October 23, 2018
Results
Price Per Unit (2

Ranking | Vendor Name City/State ea) Bid Amount
1 Fairway Ford Placentia, CA $46,322.43 $92,644.86
2 Advanced Truck Body Central Point, OR $46,422.81 $92,845.61
3 Frontier Ford Santa Clara, CA $46,905.50 $93,811.00
4 TransWest Truck Fontana, CA $47,388.66 $94,777.31
5 Western Truck Exchange | Los Angeles, CA $50,263.40 $100,526.80
6 National Auto Fleet Watsonville, CA $50,731.93 $101,463.86
7 AutoNation Ford Torrance, CA NO BID
8 Reynolds Buick/GMC Covina, CA NO BID

B2018-30 Furnish Eleven 2018 or later Pick up, Utility, and Dump

MODEL 2019

Ford F-450 XL DRW Regular Chassis Cab w/Rugby Eliminator LP Dump

or Equiv.

Bid Submittal Deadline Date:

September 12, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

Fairway Ford

City Council Meeting Approval

Date: October 23, 2018
Results
Price Per Unit (2

Ranking | Vendor Name City/State ea) Bid Amount
1 Fairway Ford Placentia, CA $53,881.22 $107,762.43
2 Advanced Truck Body Central Point, OR $54,314.47 $108,628.94
3 Frontier Ford Santa Clara, CA $54,570.50 $109,141.00
4 TransWest Truck Fontana, CA $55,407.34 $110,814.68
5 Western Truck Exchange | Los Angeles, CA $57,599.90 $115,199.80
6 National Auto Fleet Watsonville, CA $58,350.72 $116,701.44
7 AutoNation Ford Torrance, CA NO BID
8 Reynolds Buick/GMC Covina, CA NO BID

Posted 10/11/18
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RFP Number:

B2018-32

RFP Title:

RFP for Dam Inundation Mapping and Emergency Action

Plan Preparation

RFP Submittal Deadline Date:

Monday, October 8, 2018

Recommendation of Award to: Dudek
Tentative date of the City Council | December 18, 2018
Meeting for the intended award of
contract
Results
Ranking Vendor Name City State | Evaluation Proposal Price
Score
1 Dudek San Juan CA 90.5 $49,887.00
Capistrano
2 West Consultants Inc. | Fullerton CA 85.8 $48,479.00
3 CWE San Diego CA 73.8 $107,074.00
4 Alfred Civil Citrus CA 72.6 $19,716.36
Engineering Heights
Posted 11/14/18
Bid Number: B2018-33
Bid Title: Furnish and Install Control Panel at Torrance Police Department

Bid Submittal Deadline Date

October 24, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

Southern Folger Detention Equipment Company

Tentative date of the City Council Meeting for
the intended award of contract

November 27, 2018

Results
Ranking | Vendor Name City State | Award Amount
Southern Folger Detention
1* Equipment Company San Antonio TX $160,300.00
*Sole Bidder

Posted 11/01/18
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RFP Number:

B2018-38

RFP Title:

RFP for Construction Inspection Services for Sidewalk

Repair for Handicap Accessibility, 1-1435

RFP Submittal Deadline Date:

September 24, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

Wallace & Associates

Tentative date of the City Council
Meeting for the intended award of
contract

November 6, 2018

Results
Ranking Vendor Name City State Evaluation Proposal Price
Score
1 Wallace & Associates, Inc. Corona CA 93.33 $109,760
2 Onward Engineering Anaheim CA 92.00 $96,600
3 KOA Los Angeles CA 88.67 $122,000
4 Anderson Penna El Segundo CA 85.67 $128,960
5 NV5 Irvine CA 84.67 $148,200
6 MSK Consultants Santa CA 76.33 $123,600
Monica

Interested parties may view more detailed information on the project website at https://www.torranceca.gov/our-city/public-

works/civil-and-traffic-engineering/capital-improvement-projects/sidewalk-repair-for-handicap-access-cdbg-fy18-19-i-135

Posted 10/11/18

INTENT TO AWARD -  Bid Number:

B2018-44

Bid Title:

Custodial Paper Goods

Bid Submittal Deadline Date:

November 7, 2018

Recommendation of Award to:

Gale Supply Company

Tentative date of the City Council Meeting
for the intended award of contract:

December 4, 2018

Results
Price Per
Ranking Vendor Name City/State Unit Award Amount
Gale Supply Company Montebello CA S 394,075.99
Veritiv Downey CA S 397,857.00
Maintex Facility Solutions City of Industry CA S 398,142.19
P&R Paper Supply Co. Redlands CA S 399,408.59

Santa Ana CA

S 406,969.05

Empire Cleaning Supply

Montebello CA

S 416,762.28

Supplyworks

Commerce CA

$ 435,577.64

Abbot Industrial Supplies

North Hollywood CA

S 776,784.57

1
2
3
4
5| Waxie Sanitary Supply
6
7
8
8

Posted 11/16/1
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